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The vibrant spirit of Independence Day was vividly captured as students engaged in a multitude of activities to
commemorate the occasion.

The pre-primary students showcased their culinary skills bymaking tricolour paper craft, combining the hues of the
Indian flag to create a sense of pride and also taught the young learners about the significance of the national flag
and its colors.

Students across different classes delved into artistic pursuits with different activities like collage making sessions by
class 1st to 5th centered around the theme of 'Incredible India'. Their creations vividly depicted the rich cultural
tapestry and diverse heritage of our nation, showcasing their creativity and understanding of Indian culture.







The spirit of patriotism soared high, as the school community came together to celebrate Independence Day with
fervor and enthusiasm. The celebrations kicked off with a vibrant 'Prabhat Pheri' taken by the students to nearby
localities, spreading the message of freedom and unity to the community. Following this, the entire school
assembled to sing the National Anthem in unison, filling the air with patriotic fervor and pride.

The cultural extravaganza continued with mesmerizingmusic performances by the talented students of classes 4th
6th 8th and 7th , captivating the audience with their melodious renditions. This was followed by a delightful array of
dance performances by students from classes 1st to 5th, showcasing their enthusiasm and dedication towards
celebrating the nation's independence in a joyous manner.



The other students of grades 4th presented a captivating skit drama highlighting the themes of unity in diversity
where the students named – AMAN JOSHI (IV), SAGAR TIWARI (IV),MAYANK KUMAR (IV), DIVYANSH JOSHI (V) ,
MAHI BISHT (V), GUNJAN BHATT (IV) and RUDRAKSH NEGI (IV) magnificently showed the rituals and cultures of
various religion and other students from 5th, named- PIYUSH JOSHI (V), SHAURYA MANRAL MANRAL (V), VAIBHAV
NAUGAI (V) paid a tribute tribute to the revolutionary freedom fighter Bhagat Singh by their skit.



The event also featured an inspirational speech by our esteemed Director Manager Mr.Umashankar Joshi ,
motivating students to uphold the values of freedom, unity, and integrity. Furthermore, Prerna Bisht and Yuvaan
Pandey recited patriotic poems, stirring the emotions of the audience and instilling a sense of pride in our nation's
history and heritage.
The youngest members of the school, i.e the students from the pre-primary wing, charmed everyone with their
adorable fancy dress competition, showcasing their creativity and enthusiasm for celebrating Independence Day in
their unique way.

Rakhi Celebrations Bring Students Closer: A Bond of Love and Friendship

In a heartwarming display of tradition and camaraderie, students from class 4th at our school came together to
celebrate Rakhi. The girls lovingly tied colorful rakhis on the wrists of their male classmates, symbolizing the bond of
protection and love between siblings.



The atmosphere was filled with joy and laughter as the students exchanged sweets and heartfelt wishes,
strengthening their friendships and forming special bonds. The boys proudly wore the rakhis, pledging to protect and
support their sisters in times of need.

A Colorful and Joyous Celebration of Janmashtami

Students from Nursery to 3rd grade at our school came together to celebrate Janmashtami with great joy and
enthusiasm. The young children showcased various incidents from Lord Krishna's life, including his birth (Krishna
Janam), stealing butter (Makhan Chori), and breaking the pot of curd (Dahi Handi).

The highlight of the celebration was the role-play of Lord Krishna by Yuvaan Pandey from Class 2nd, who brought
the character to life with his portrayal of the mischievous but endearing deity. Additionally, Chitransh Joshi from
Pre-Primary also played an important role of infant Krishna in the enactment, adding charm and innocence to the
performance.







In a remarkable display of knowledge and dedication, students from class 6th and onwards at our school have
excelled in the prestigious "Bharat Ko Jaano" exam. The students showcased their exceptional understanding of
Indian history, culture, and current affairs by securing top positions in the examination.
The outstanding performance of our students reflects their hard work, commitment to learning, and the quality of
education provided at our school. The teachers' guidance and support have undoubtedly played a crucial role in
preparing the students for such a challenging competition.





In a display of exceptional linguistic prowess, students from Class 7 showcased their talents in the prestigious inter-
class English competition, 'Literary Luminary'. The event, consisting of four challenging rounds, tested the
participants' language skills and creative thinking. The competition kicked off with the 'Codified' round, where the
young linguists deciphered complex codes to showcase their decoding abilities. Following this, the 'Spell Bee' round
put their spelling knowledge to the test, with students demonstrating accuracy and fluency in spelling a variety of
words.
In the third round, 'Spell out the Spelling', participants were tasked with not only spelling words correctly but also
enunciating them clearly and confidently. The final round, 'Riddles', challenged students to think critically and
creatively to unravel the mysteries posed to them.

In this competition DEEPAK SANWAL secured 1st position, JATIN SINGH BISHT secured 2nd position and ASHUTOSH
SANWAL secured 3rd position.

In a recent event at our school, the 4th-grade students successfully organized a 'Bal Kavi Sammelan'. The young
poets enthralled everyone with their beautiful poetry recitations and presentations, captivating the audience.
This event not only encouraged the creative abilities of the children but also sparked an interest in literature among
them. They showcased their emotional poems on various topics and displayed their artistic talents during the event.



In an atmosphere of academic rigor and determination, our school successfully conducted Unit Test 2 across all
classes, from Nursery to 12th grade. The testing period, spanning 45 minutes, was a testament to the dedication and
hard work of both students and staff. Students showcased their knowledge and understanding in various subjects,
from foundational concepts in Nursery to advanced topics in the higher grades.

A Stylish Addition to School Attire: The New School Jersey is Here!
Our school recently unveiled its brand new jersey for the students, adding a touch of style and spirit to their school
attire. The vibrant and sleek design of the jersey reflects the school colors and emblem, creating a sense of unity and
pride among the students.



A Day of Fun, Fitness, and Friendship

On the auspicious occasion ofMajor Dhyan Chand's birth anniversary, students at our school came together to
celebrate Sports Day with great fervor and enthusiasm. The event was a vibrant display of sportsmanship, teamwork,
and a celebration of the spirit of sports.



Recently our students from class 1st to 10th showcased their linguistic skills by participating in the prestigious
International Hindi Olympiad exam. With enthusiasm and dedication, our young scholars demonstrated their
proficiency in Hindi language and literature.









Our school recently organized a Parent-Teacher Meeting (PTM) to discuss the progress and performance of students
in Unit Test-2. The PTM was held in a structured and organized manner, with individual sessions for each student's
parents to discuss their child's performance. Teachers shared detailed feedback on the student's academic progress,
strengths, areas for improvement, and overall behavior in the classroom.





Furthermore, parents were updated about upcoming assessments, extracurricular activities, and school events to
ensure their active involvement in their child's school life.
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